
he Roland Stafford Golf School is entering its 37th 
year in the northern Catskill Mountain Region of 
New York State in Windham, New York, also 
known as “Town in the Sky”. Our home is the new 
and spectacular Windham Country Club just 2 1/2 
hours north of Manhattan and 1 1/4 hours 
southwest of Albany. Windham Country Club 
dates back to 1928 and Golf Digest rates this 6024 
yard golf course with 3 1/2 Stars and a “must” 
play. The course is scenic and challenging and 
demanding of all your shots. Improve your swing, 
your around-the-green shots and your putting on 
the specifically designed practice areas. Then take 
your game to this beautifully manicured 18-hole 
golf course. Three sets of tees allow players of all 
abilities to enjoy their round of golf.

The Club House with its 7300 square feet of 
interior space under cathedral wood ceilings is 
spectacular. Mulligan’s Pub overlooks the golf 
course and is accessible to the 20 foot wide deck 
where food and drinks may also be enjoyed, a great 
choice for lunch. The school facilities are on the 
driving range with a school room for video analysis 
of your swing. Our pro-shop is located on the 
ground floor and Golf Director, PGA Professional 
Dal Daily, extends his 20% member discount on all 
soft goods to the golf school students. Locker 
rooms with showers are adjacent to the pro-shop.

Contact us for more information or to make 
a reservation.

1.800.447.8894




